## VERNIS & BOWLING OF THE FLORIDA KEYS, PA 1680 N.E. 135th STREET MIAMI, FL 33181 (305) 895-3035

\*OUR FEDERAL I.D.NUMBER IS: 65-0437103\*

February 26, 2021 Reference No. 270262

MONROE COUNTY SCHOOL BOARD C/O VERNIS & BOWLING OF THE FLORIDA KEYS, P.A.

ATTN: PATTI NICOLAS 81990 OVERSEAS HIGHWAY TAVERNIER, FL 33036

I herem Chiford

For Professional		Services	Concerning:					
Matter Num	ber:	0305	0010849	DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD O MATTERS ATTN: PATTI NICOLAS CLIENT: MONROE COUNTY S			GENERAL	
				(ATTY DMS)				
Date		Descrip			Rate	Hours	Fees	
01/04/21	GPJ		PONDENCE WIT US EDITS	H H. LINN RE INQUIRY ON	155.00	0.20	31.00	
01/04/21	GPJ			NCE WITH G. PEATTIE RE ETERMINATION	155.00	0.20	31.00	
01/06/21	DMS			CORRESPONDENCE X37 FROM H JANUARY 6.	165.00	3.70	610.50	
01/06/21	GPJ		SE TO REQUES	HENRIQUEZ ET. AL. RE T FOR D.W. EDUCATION	155.00	1.30	201.50	
01/06/21	GPJ .		DW EVENT T . PEATTIE ET	IMELINE. CORRESPONDENCE AL RE SAME	155.00	1.00	155.00	
01/06/21	GPJ	CORRES!		WITH G. PEATTIE RE D.W.	155.00	0.20	31.00	
01/06/21	PL	PROVID:		ERTIFICATE FOR CLIENT'S	105.00	0.10	10.50	
01/07/21	DMS	ROUTIN	E CALLS AND	CORRESPONDENCE X21.	165.00	2.10	346.50	
01/07/21	DRC	VOLUNTA		SSION REGARDING MMITTEE AND QUORUM GISLATION	165.00	1.30	214.50	
01/08/21	DMS	ROUTINI X19.	E CORRESPOND	ENCE AND TELEPHONE CALLS	165.00	1.90	313.50	
01/11/21	DMS	ATTEND AND SU		COVID COORDINATING CALL	165.00	0.30	49.50	
01/11/21	DMS	ROUTIN	E CALLS AND	CORRESPONDENCE X5.	165.00	0.50	82.50	
01/11/21	DMS		CH AND CALLS	WITH SHERIFF'S ATTORNEY C.	165.00	1.10	181.50	
01/11/21	PL	RESOLU'		G FOR N.W. FOLLOW UP IEP C. CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. AME.	105.00	0.20	21.00	
01/12/21	DMS			CORRESPONDENCE X14.	165.00	1.40	231.00	
01/12/21	SCB			G AND REVIEW OF FS 1012 G FOR PARAPROFESSIONALS	165.00	0.20	33.00	
01/12/21	PL	CORRES	PONDENCE WIT	H J. JESSUP AND K. BARTH	105.00	0.10	10.50	

Page 2 Reference No. 270262

			Reference	No. 270262	
		REGARDING FOLLOW UP ZOOM MEETING FOR N.W. IEP RESOLUTION.			
01/13/21	DMS	ROUTINE CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE X10.	165.00	1.00	165.00
01/13/21	DRC	CONFERENCE REGARDING HOUSING REQUIRMENTS AND AGO OPINION	165.00	0.30	49.50
01/13/21	PL	TELEPHONIC CORRESPONDENCE WITH DOAH REPRESENTATIVES REGARDING PAYMENT FOR N.W. DUE PROCESS PROCEEDINGS.	105.00	0,20	21.00
01/13/21	ΡĻ	TELEPHONIC CORRESPONDENCE X2 WITH J. JESSUP REGARDING FOLLOW UP CALL FOR N.W. DOAH DISCUSSION.	105.00	0.20	21.00
01/13/21	PL	CORRESPONDENCE X5 WITH K. BARTH REGARDING FOLLOW UP CALL FOR N.W. DOAH DISCUSSION.	105.00	0.50	52.50
01/15/21	DMS	ROUTINE CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE X30.	165.00	3.00	495.00
01/18/21	DMS	ROUTINE CORRESPONDENCE AND CALLS X2.	165.00	0.20	33.00
01/19/21	DMS	ROUTINE CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE X7.	165.00	0.70	115.50
01/19/21	PL	CORRESPONDENCE X12 WITH K. BARTH, J. JESSUP, AND STAFF REGARDING CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY JONES.	105.00	0.60	63.00
01/20/21	DMS	ROUTINE CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE X8.	165.00	0.80	132.00
01/20/21	DRC	DISCUSSION AND CONFERENCE WITH GPJ REGARDING IEP AND EVALUATIONS	165.00	0.30	49.50
01/21/21	DMS	ROUTINE CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE X12.	165.00	1.20	198.00
01/22/21	PL	DRAFT MEDICAL RECORDS REQUEST TO D.W. MEDICAL PROVIDER AND FAX.	105.00	0.30	31.50
01/22/21	PL	TELEPHONIC CORRESPONDENCE WITH MEDICAL PROVIDER REGARDING D.W. RECORDS.	105.00	0.20	21.00
01/22/21	PL	RESEARCH D.W. MEDICAL PROVIDER RECORDS REQUEST INFORMATION. TELEPHONE CALL AND CORRESPONDENCE.	105.00	0.40	42.00
01/22/21	PL	CORRESPONDENCE X2 WITH ATTORNEY JONES REGARDING RECORDS REQUESTS FOR D.W.	105.00	0.20	21.00
01/27/21	DMS	ROUTINE CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE X6.	165.00	0.60	99.00
01/27/21	GPJ	REVIEW AND APPROVE MOTION TO CONTINUE HEARING AND FOR EXTENSION OF TIME FOR N.W.	155.00	0.20	31.00
01/27/21	GPJ	REVIEW AND APPROVAL OF STATUS REPORT FOR N.W. DOAH CASE.	155.00	0.20	31,00
01/27/21	PL	DRAFT MOTION TO CONTINUE HEARING AND FOR EXTENSION OF TIME FOR N.W.	105.00	0.40	42.00
01/27/21	PL	DRAFT STATUS REPORT FOR N.W. DOAH CASE.	105.00	0.40	42.00
01/29/21	GPJ	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF MEDICAL RECORDS FROM SANDY PINES FOR D.W.	155.00	2.50	387.50
01/29/21	PL	CALLS AND CORRESPONDENCE X3 WITH MEDICAL PROVIDER REGARDING RELEASE OF D.W.'S RECORDS.	105.00	0.30	31.50
01/29/21	ĽΜ	DRAFT LETTER TO ATTORNEY GENERAL REQUESTING OPINION ON SUGARLOAF HOUSING PROJECT REGARDING INSPECTION, BUILDING APPROVAL REQUIREMENTS, AND BUILDING CODE STANDARDS.	155.00	2.80	434.00
COSTS ADVA	NCED		33.30	5,162.50	
Date		ption			7
01/12/21	DIVISI	ON OF ADMINISTRATIVE HEARINGS; Invoice # 005 TION SUPPORT VENDORS	644A;		Amount 139.50